
 

JUNIOR PLANNING 

5 day plan for August 17th - 21st 

 

These are all just suggestions and you can swap days, times and activities so that it suits you and your child. 

Please contact your child’s teacher with any questions or help. If you want you can share photos of what you have been doing at the 

end of the day or week through the class email list.  

 

Don’t forget to help your child to choose a nursery rhyme (year 1) or poem (Year 2) to practice reading aloud at home. We will 

hopefully be having our Poetry Recital in a couple of weeks. 

 

Free on-line Reading at Oxford Owl https://www.oxfordowl.co.uk/for-home/find-a-book/library-page/ 

 

 Suggested 
Times  

Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday 

 Activity 
time 

Go for a walk or a 
bike along the beach, 
and find some shells 
and sticks to make 
things with. 

Morning Yoga. Either 
go to 
www.cosmicyoga.com 
or make up your own 
stretch routine.  

Moovlee - Dodge the 
Monsters! Workout for 
Kids 
https://www.youtube.c
om/watch?v=toi50kBc
LM8 

Alphabet Yoga with 
Moovlee 
Practise your 
alphabet by moving 
to the letter poses. 

Go for a walk in the 
bush at the Donkey 
Park, Algies Bay or 
Scandrett Regional 
Park. Look for native 
plants and trees. 

 Academic 
time 
 
Maori 
Inquiry  

Recount News Writing 
 
Draw a picture about 
what you have been 
doing in the 5 days 
that we have been at 
home.  Write a story 
about what you have 
been doing. 
Remember to use 
fullstops and capital 
letters to make 
sentences. Also use 
time words to 

Writing 
 
Watch the story of 
Maui and Tieke 
https://www.youtube.co
m/watch?v=5I_HP6Vfu
ks 
 
Draw a picture of what 
happens in the story 
Get mum or dad to 
help you write some of 
the words you might  

Writing 
 
Watch the story- How 
the kiwi lost his wings 
https://www.youtube.c
om/watch?v=A_saeTJ
KfgA 
Sand art version - 
https://www.youtube.c
om/watch?v=A_saeTJ
KfgA 
Draw a picture of what 
happened in the story. 
Beginning, middle and 

Writing 
 
Watch the story- 
The fish of Maui 
https://www.youtube
.com/watch?v=Nb9
Y99KQG1k 
Draw a picture of 
what happens in the 
story 
Get mum or dad to 
help you write some 
of the words you 
might  need on a 

One Day A Taniwha 
 
https://www.youtube
.com/watch?v=zsYlZ
kevrKA 
 
What is a Taniwha - 
Fabulous monsters 
that live in the water 
https://www.youtube
.com/watch?v=fbCr7
Hlp3rQ 
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sequence your ideas 
(first, next, then, 
last…) 
 

need on a piece of 
paper to help you 

end. Rewrite the story 
in your own words. 

piece of paper to 
help you 
Rewrite the story in 
your own words. 

Describe your 
taniwha. What does 
it look like & eat? 
Where does it 
live?What does it 
like to do? What is 
it’s personality and 
temper like?  
Year 2s could write 
a narrative about 
your taniwha. 
Imagine an 
adventure that your 
taniwha could have. 
What problem could 
it have? How will it 
solve the problem? 

 Creative 
time 

Pick some flowers 
and make a bunch to 
give someone. 
Keep 2 flowers for a 
science experiment 
later today. 

Maui was a superhero: 
Create your own comic 
with yourself as a 
superhero.  
https://www.schoolkit.c
o.nz/ideas-to-
steal/2020/6/5/athome 

Out of fabric or 
different coloured 
paper make a kiwi 
collage with a native 
bush background 
 
We have a printable 
kiwi-life-cycle-activity-
sheet.pdf ask for it to 
be emailed to you if 
you want 

Use your senses. 
Find 5 things you 
can smell, taste, 
touch, see and feel. 

Create your own 
Taniwha that looks 
after you and your 
family 

 

 Lunch      

 Responsi
bility time 

Tidy your bedroom 
and put some toys 
away 

Sort the tupperware 
drawer.  

Do the dishes after 
lunch. 

Water the 
houseplants and 
snip off any dead 
leaves 

Ask your parents 
what job you can do 
to help them 
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 Quiet time Lego creative time Read your favourite 
book to your teddy. 

Play with some 
playdough, recipe 
https://www.familyedu
cation.com/fun/playdo
ugh/play-doh-recipes 
 

Build a puzzle Play knucklebones 
(use 5 stones) 
Each player must 
toss one stone into 
the air, pick up the 
others, and then 
catch the first stone 
before it falls, all in 
one hand.  

 Maths/ 
Science 
time 

Move a block around 
a maze using 
direction arrows. 
https://www.starfall.co
m/h/geometry/3D-
space/? 
 
Or change the colour 
of a flower science 
experiment 
https://www.youtube.c
om/watch?v=GXyLfjE-
wnU&feature=youtu.b
e 
 

Find two dice. Toss 
them and record the 
number problem with 
an answer. See if you 
can find the highest 
number and count on 
from it to work out the 
answer without 
counting all the dots in 
the dice. 
 
You can also use 
dominoes. Add the 2 
numbers on the 
dominoes together. If 
you want a printable 
worksheet email your 
teacher. 

Skip Counting 
https://www.youtube.c
om/watch?v=O-
cARYvdtB4&t=1s 
 
NZ Maths skip 
counting activity 
https://nzmaths.co.nz/
sites/default/files/Activi
ties/SkipCountinIn2sA
nd5s.pdf 
 

Make Rewena 
Bread for dinner 
https://www.youtube
.com/watch?v=LGlj
N09VZi4 
 

Check out 
‘engineering and 
science challenges’ 
https://www.jamesdy
sonfoundation.com/c
ontent/dam/pdf/US%
20challenge%20car
ds%20with%20cove
r.pdf? 
Fun science 
challenge cards for 
kids 
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